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Event Calendar

October 2025

01 — Wednesday

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced
sailing skills through games and adventures on the water. Children must have done Tackers 2 prior to registration.

09:00 — 14:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

02 — Thursday

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced
sailing skills through games and adventures on the water. Children must have done Tackers 2 prior to registration.

09:00 — 14:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

03 — Friday

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced
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sailing skills through games and adventures on the water. Children must have done Tackers 2 prior to registration.

09:00 — 14:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

04 — Saturday

08:00 — 11:00 Optimist Coaching

Optimist Coaching with Foundation Coach Matthew

09:00 — 16:00 QLD ILCA Coaching

QLD ILCA coaching weekend for HYC ILCA sailors - October 4th & 5th

05 — Sunday

09:00 — 16:00 QLD ILCA Coaching

QLD ILCA coaching weekend for HYC ILCA sailors - October 4th & 5th

06 — Monday

No events

07 — Tuesday

No events

08 — Wednesday

No events

09 — Thursday

No events

10 — Friday

No events

11 — Saturday

09:00 — 16:00 HumpyBash 2025

Over the weekend of the 12th and 13th October 2024, the Humpybong Yacht Club will host its annual Humpybash regatta for all off-
the-beach dinghies and catamarans.

12 — Sunday

09:00 — 16:00 HumpyBash 2025

Over the weekend of the 12th and 13th October 2024, the Humpybong Yacht Club will host its annual Humpybash regatta for all off-
the-beach dinghies and catamarans.

13 — Monday

No events

14 — Tuesday

No events

15 — Wednesday

No events

16 — Thursday

No events
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17 — Friday

No events

18 — Saturday

08:00 — 10:30 Optimist Coaching

Optimist Coaching with Foundation Coach Matthew

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 1 - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Start Sailing 1 is the start of your journey. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 2 - Adult Learn to Sail

Your journey continues as you gain more confidence and learn the skills necessary to skipper your own dinghy safely. Only $350 for
4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Better Sailing - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Continue your journey with Better Sailing. Only $350 for 4 days.

19 — Sunday

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced sailing skills through
games and adventures on the water. Sundays in school term 4 from 8:30am until 11am. $330 for the term.

08:30 — 11:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

10:00 — 16:00 Club Point Score

Club Point Score Round 5 Sign On 10.30am Briefing 11am

20 — Monday

No events

21 — Tuesday

No events

22 — Wednesday

No events

23 — Thursday

No events

24 — Friday

No events

25 — Saturday

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 1 - Adult Learn to Sail
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As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Start Sailing 1 is the start of your journey. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 2 - Adult Learn to Sail

Your journey continues as you gain more confidence and learn the skills necessary to skipper your own dinghy safely. Only $350 for
4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Better Sailing - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Continue your journey with Better Sailing. Only $350 for 4 days.

26 — Sunday

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced sailing skills through
games and adventures on the water. Sundays in school term 4 from 8:30am until 11am. $330 for the term.

08:30 — 11:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

10:00 — 16:00 Club Championships

Club Championships Please register prior to event Sign On 10.30am Briefing 11am

27 — Monday

No events

28 — Tuesday

No events

29 — Wednesday

No events

30 — Thursday

No events

31 — Friday

No events

November 2025

01 — Saturday

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 1 - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Start Sailing 1 is the start of your journey. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 2 - Adult Learn to Sail

Your journey continues as you gain more confidence and learn the skills necessary to skipper your own dinghy safely. Only $350 for
4 days.
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09:00 — 14:00 Better Sailing - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Continue your journey with Better Sailing. Only $350 for 4 days.

02 — Sunday

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced sailing skills through
games and adventures on the water. Sundays in school term 4 from 8:30am until 11am. $330 for the term.

08:30 — 11:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

03 — Monday

No events

04 — Tuesday

No events

05 — Wednesday

No events

06 — Thursday

No events

07 — Friday

No events

08 — Saturday

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 1 - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Start Sailing 1 is the start of your journey. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 2 - Adult Learn to Sail

Your journey continues as you gain more confidence and learn the skills necessary to skipper your own dinghy safely. Only $350 for
4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Better Sailing - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Continue your journey with Better Sailing. Only $350 for 4 days.

09 — Sunday

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.
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08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced sailing skills through
games and adventures on the water. Sundays in school term 4 from 8:30am until 11am. $330 for the term.

08:30 — 11:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

10:00 — 16:00 Club Point Score

Club Point Score Round 5 Sign On 10.30am Briefing 11am

10 — Monday

No events

11 — Tuesday

No events

12 — Wednesday

No events

13 — Thursday

No events

14 — Friday

No events

15 — Saturday

No events

16 — Sunday

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced sailing skills through
games and adventures on the water. Sundays in school term 4 from 8:30am until 11am. $330 for the term.

08:30 — 11:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

10:00 — 16:00 Club Championships

Club Championships Please register prior to event Sign On 10.30am Briefing 11am

17 — Monday

No events

18 — Tuesday

No events

19 — Wednesday
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No events

20 — Thursday

No events

21 — Friday

No events

22 — Saturday

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 1 - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Start Sailing 1 is the start of your journey. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Better Sailing - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Continue your journey with Better Sailing. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 2 - Adult Learn to Sail

Your journey continues as you gain more confidence and learn the skills necessary to skipper your own dinghy safely. Only $350 for
4 days.

23 — Sunday

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced sailing skills through
games and adventures on the water. Sundays in school term 4 from 8:30am until 11am. $330 for the term.

08:30 — 11:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

10:00 — 16:00 Club Point Score

Club Point Score Round 5 Sign On 10.30am Briefing 11am

24 — Monday

No events

25 — Tuesday

No events

26 — Wednesday

No events

27 — Thursday

No events

28 — Friday

No events

29 — Saturday
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09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 1 - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Start Sailing 1 is the start of your journey. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Better Sailing - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Continue your journey with Better Sailing. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 2 - Adult Learn to Sail

Your journey continues as you gain more confidence and learn the skills necessary to skipper your own dinghy safely. Only $350 for
4 days.

30 — Sunday

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced sailing skills through
games and adventures on the water. Sundays in school term 4 from 8:30am until 11am. $330 for the term.

08:30 — 11:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

10:00 — 16:00 Club Championships

Club Championships Please register prior to event Sign On 10.30am Briefing 11am

December 2025

01 — Monday

No events

02 — Tuesday

No events

03 — Wednesday

No events

04 — Thursday

No events

05 — Friday

No events

06 — Saturday

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 1 - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Start Sailing 1 is the start of your journey. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Better Sailing - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.

Page 8 of 11 Accessed at 16 Oct 2025 at 06:23:22



Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Continue your journey with Better Sailing. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 2 - Adult Learn to Sail

Your journey continues as you gain more confidence and learn the skills necessary to skipper your own dinghy safely. Only $350 for
4 days.

07 — Sunday

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

08:30 — 11:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced sailing skills through
games and adventures on the water. Sundays in school term 4 from 8:30am until 11am. $330 for the term.

08:30 — 11:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

08 — Monday

No events

09 — Tuesday

No events

10 — Wednesday

No events

11 — Thursday

No events

12 — Friday

No events

13 — Saturday

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 1 - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Start Sailing 1 is the start of your journey. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Better Sailing - Adult Learn to Sail

As an off-the-beach sailing club we have a wide range of dinghies and small catamarans to offer a great way to get into sailing.
Sailing a dinghy or catamaran can be fun and exhilarating. Continue your journey with Better Sailing. Only $350 for 4 days.

09:00 — 14:00 Start Sailing 2 - Adult Learn to Sail

Your journey continues as you gain more confidence and learn the skills necessary to skipper your own dinghy safely. Only $350 for
4 days.

14 — Sunday

No events

15 — Monday

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
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the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced
sailing skills through games and adventures on the water. Children must have done Tackers 2 prior to registration.

09:00 — 14:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

16 — Tuesday

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced
sailing skills through games and adventures on the water. Children must have done Tackers 2 prior to registration.

09:00 — 14:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

17 — Wednesday

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced
sailing skills through games and adventures on the water. Children must have done Tackers 2 prior to registration.

09:00 — 14:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

18 — Thursday

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 1 - Having Fun

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 1 introduces children to
the basics of sailing through games on and off the water.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 2 - Tricks & Techniques

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 2 aims to build on the
fun participants had at Tackers 1, progressing their sailing skills.

09:00 — 14:00 Kids Learn to Sail - Tackers 3 - Sailing Fast

Tackers is aimed at providing kids aged 7-12 with a fun, safe, and affordable way to get into sailing. Tackers 3 focuses on advanced
sailing skills through games and adventures on the water. Children must have done Tackers 2 prior to registration.
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09:00 — 14:00 OutThere Sailing for Teens

Created for 12-17 year olds who want to try sailing in a non-competitive, social and fun setting. OutThere Sailing is the perfect way to
have fun on the water without any long term commitment.

19 — Friday

No events

20 — Saturday

No events

21 — Sunday

No events

22 — Monday

No events

23 — Tuesday

No events

24 — Wednesday

No events

25 — Thursday

No events

26 — Friday

No events

27 — Saturday

No events

28 — Sunday

No events

29 — Monday

No events

30 — Tuesday

No events

31 — Wednesday

No events
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